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Chapter 2796

Just when Zhifei drove back to the Du’s old house, and Anson set off for the airport
overnight, the Du’s old house at this time had become a sea of   joy.

The brothers and sisters of the Du family have been cultivated to be exceptionally
united under the guidance of their father since they were young.

In fact, regardless of whether brothers and sisters are close relatives, in the final
analysis, in most families with children, it is difficult for the relationship between children
to be absolutely intimate.

Especially when the children are all grown-ups, and after their respective families start
their own businesses, the big family with brothers and sisters is naturally less important
than the small family with wives and children.

Therefore, in real life and on the TV, we can often see that brothers and sisters turn their
faces because of the fight for family property, or quarrel and even fight because of
parental issues.

Moreover, this is not only true of the poor but even more so for the rich.

However, the brothers and sisters of the Du family are really twisted into a rope.

Liona had an accident, and her brothers and sisters put aside everything in their hands,
regardless of all costs, just to find her and her daughter.

Now that she has finally returned safely, these brothers and sisters are naturally
extremely happy!



The eldest sister Haya had asked the chef to cook a new table, and she was waiting for
her sister and niece to come, and the family to have a good celebration.

But when they came back, Haya couldn’t even care about her sister’s dinner.

She hugged the sister, and suddenly cried into tears.

The family surrounded the mother and the daughter and asked them endlessly. The
questions were also very concentrated.

They just wanted to know who took them away after they had a car accident in the
tunnel. Where did they go after they were taken away?

And they must have been severely injured in the car accident, so who on earth was
healing this injury?

Chapter 2797
Liona faced the problems of her family and lied against her will: “Actually, Zhiyu and I
still don’t know who saved us. After the car accident, we were almost unconscious when
we woke up. We were already lying in a ward, and we can’t see anything related to the
name of the hospital in the ward.

The doctors who came to treat us also wore masks and could not recognize who they
were.”

Renel hurriedly asked her: “Then have you remembered the surrounding environment,
for example, what are the distinctive buildings outside the window?”

“No.” Liona shook her head and said: “In our ward, the windows were covered with
opaque black glass film.

Nothing could be seen, Zhiyu and I have been in the room during this period. We eat
and drink, and provide all the daily necessities we need, but they just don’t let us leave.”

Elijah asked in surprise: “Then how did they let you leave now?”



“I don’t know.” Liona lied: “They suddenly brought me and Zhiyu out, and then gave me
a mobile phone to let me contact the family, and then I called you.”

Elijah frowned and pondered: “This thing sounds strange. The person who saved you
should be very powerful.

He rescued you. He gave you treatment. In the end, even the identity not revealed.

He didn’t want to disclose, and he released you back without any conditions. I can’t
figure out why he is busy with this big circle…”

Simon said, “Dad, maybe the other party is the opponent of the Su family. They couldn’t
understand what the Su family did, so they rescued Liona and Zhiyu.”

Elijah asked:

“The opponent of the Su family? Who?

The Wade family? Although the Wade family is ranked second, how can they have this
kind of ability?”

Simon nodded slightly: “Dad’s words are reasonable… Wade family should not be able
to bear this…”

After speaking, he hurriedly asked Liona again: “Liona, you and Zhiyu have been
rescued for so long, haven’t you found any clues?”

Liona quickly said: “I haven’t left the ward these days. I only saw doctors and nurses,
but the doctors and nurses didn’t tell us anything.”

Simon asked again: “The person who saved you never showed up?”

Liona said, “No, he didn’t want to expose his identity.”

Elijah didn’t have much doubt, and sighed: “It seems that the knights are not only in the
novels of Old legends but also in real life.”



As he said, he suddenly thought of something and asked Zhiyu: “By the way, Zhiyu,
when you and Zhifei were in Japan, you were also saved by a mysterious man?”

“Yes…” Zhiyu said hurriedly: “Thanks to my benefactor that time, otherwise, my brother
and I would be dead in the hands of Japanese ninjas.”

Chapter 2798
Elijah sighed sincerely: “One person can easily kill multiple ninjas. This is really
amazing. It is not an exaggeration to say that he is a hero!”

After speaking, he hurriedly asked again with a flash of inspiration: “By the way, could
he be the one who saved you this time?”

Zhiyu vaguely said: “This…I can’t say this. After all, I haven’t seen the true content, but
it’s possible…”

Elijah nodded and said: “This man has his own motives to help you, anyway, it’s okay!”

After that, he poured himself a glass of wine and said loudly: “Come! Let’s have a drink
together to celebrate the safe return of Liona and Zhiyu!”

The whole family was also excited, and one after another they picked up their wine
glasses.

At this moment, Zhifei ran in quickly.

“Mom! Zhiyu!”

Seeing his mother and sister sitting at the dining table intact, Zhifei yelled
subconsciously.

However, he was not so excited in his heart.

Even, a little lost.



Seeing his mother and sister in peace, he knew in his heart that he would lose a huge
advantage in front of his grandfather Chengfeng.

He has feelings for his mother and sister in his heart.

However, in the face of the Su family’s trillions of wealth, feelings did seem a little pale.

The greater the immediate benefits, the weaker the family relationship.

This is the characteristic of mankind since ancient times.

In ancient times, countless royal family fratricides occurred across the world.

It is not uncommon among the royal family that fathers kill sons, sons kill fathers, and
even brothers kill each other.

It’s not that they really have no affection.

On the contrary, family affection is really not worth mentioning in the face of huge
benefits.

If it is placed in a poor house, the two brothers’ three-square-acre land for their parents
may turn their faces, and they may stay out of each other for a lifetime, but it is difficult
to kill the brother because of one-square-acre land.

However, when this three-acre land became the power and wealth of the entire
kingdom, the brotherhood and family affection became less important.

Zhifei’s heart at this time, the loss and disappointment are far greater than that point of
comfort.

However, he was hiding it pretty well, and no one was able to see anything unusual.

When Zhiyu saw him, her eyes reddened immediately.

Almost without thinking, she stood up, ran in front of Zhifei, and plunged into his arms,
crying and said, “Brother… I thought I would never see you in this life…”



Chapter 2799
After Zhiyu’s accident, what she misses most and worry about most is her brother Zhifei.

After all, their small family consists of four people in total. Mother has always been with
her, and father has some stains, and these stains make him a little unacceptable, so
she naturally misses her brother the most.

Moreover, when she was in Japan, she experienced life and death with her brother, so
the relationship between brother and sister was deeper.

Although Zhifei was disappointed in his heart, he still pretended to be distressed and
patted her back gently, and said with emotion:

“Zhiyu, it’s best if you and mom are fine. During this time, I was so much worried… “

When grandfather Elijah heard this, he looked at him coldly, somewhat dissatisfied in
his heart.

He feels that his grandson has become a little hypocritical recently.

Zhifei was really anxious at first because of an accident with his mother and sister.

He even quarreled with his grandfather and drove to Aurous Hill by himself overnight.

However, these days, Elijah felt that Zhifei seemed to pay less attention to the affairs of
his mother and sister.

Although he has been in Aurous Hill, he has rarely directly participated in the search for
the whereabouts of the two.

He is busy doing concert arrangements every day. It feels as if the importance of
concerts is a bit more than his mother and sister.

However, Elijah naturally didn’t say anything at this time, and the dissatisfaction in his
heart was crushed by him deep inside.

At this time, Renel said:



“Zhifei and Zhiyu sit down quickly. It just happens that we are just starting to eat.

You also have two drinks together to celebrate the safe return of your mother and
sister!”

Zhifei hurriedly said: “OK, uncle!”

After sitting down, Zhifei and other family members toasted again to celebrate, but he
always had a doubt in his heart: who saved his mother and sister.

However, with so many people on the table right now, it is difficult for him to question
Zhiyu in detail, so he can only temporarily suppress this question to the bottom of his
heart.

Just when he and his family were pushing cups and changing cups, the phone suddenly
received a WeChat message.

He looked down and saw that it was his grandfather Chengfeng who sent him this
message.

He hurriedly clicked and viewed the message sent by Chengfeng, which read: “Zhifei, I
want to know if the person who saved your mother and your sister this time is the
Chinese who saved you in Japan?

You have always had a relationship with Zhiyu. Get close, you must find a way to get
the truth out of her mouth!”

Chapter 2800
Zhifei twitched in his heart, and said to himself, “Why did Grandpa ask?! Is it really the
benefactor who saved Mom and Zhiyu?

But…it’s a bit unlikely. The benefactor is in Japan, and Zhiyu was looking for him. She
hasn’t got any results for so long. How could he suddenly appear in Aurous Hill and
save Zhiyu again?



Is he a stalker who has been following Zhiyu in secret? Then Zhiyu has been looking for
him for so long, why didn’t he show up? …It always feels weird and unbelievable…”

Reminiscent of the second uncle and father disappearing in Aurous Hill one after
another, Zhifei felt even bigger.

“I always feel that it is unlikely that the benefactor is behind this. Otherwise, even if he
secretly protects Zhiyu, he doesn’t need to attack my second uncle and my father one
after another, right?

The Su family has never offended him from beginning to end, and even suffered a lot
from him. Why should he act on the Su family?”

After thinking about it for a long time, Zhifei couldn’t understand the cause and effect.
He could only temporarily put these thoughts behind him, and quietly replied to
Chengfeng: “OK, grandpa, I must find a way to ask Zhiyu.”

…

While Liona and Zhiyu reunited with their family and gathered together, Charlie also
returned to his home.

This trip to Syria did not take too long. Although Charlie flew back and forth tens of
thousands of kilometers, and many things happened, it was actually just one night.

Therefore, when he returned home, his wife Claire, his father-in-law Jacob, and his
mother-in-law Elaine were very surprised.

Claire had just had dinner with her parents. Seeing Charlie came back, she hurriedly
stepped forward to help him take off his coat, and said in surprise: “Husband, why did
you come back in such a short time when you went out this time?”

Charlie smiled and said, “This time the matter was relatively simple, I came back directly
after handling the things.”

Claire hurriedly asked: “Then have you eaten dinner? I made the noodles at night,
which was quite delicious, so I will order you some noodles?”



Charlie asked curiously: “Claire, aren’t you busy during this time? Why do you have so
much time today, and you still have to cook by yourself.”

Claire smiled and said: “I went to the Emgrand Group for a meeting this afternoon. The
first phase of the plan has completely passed the review of the Group, so I can relax a
little bit. It just so happens that I came home early today, and spent some time in our
vegetable garden.

The garlic moss grows quite well, so I picked a little bit and cooked the garlic sprouts
fried pork, and marinated noodles.”

As she said, she hurriedly took Charlie’s hand to the restaurant, and spoke as she
walked:

“It’s such a short time for you to go back and forth. It must be very hard to travel too
much in a short time. I will cook the noodles for you!”

Seeing Claire caring about him so much, Charlie was also moved in his heart, nodded
lightly, and smiled: “Then it will be hard work for you wife.”

Claire smiled sweetly: “There is no hardship, no hardship at all.”

Entering the restaurant, father-in-law Jacob and his mother-in-law Elaine had just
finished their meal. Seeing Charlie come in, Jacob said with joy:

“Oh! Good son-in-law is back, where did you go this time? You came back so soon.”


