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At this moment, Lady Peach Blossom looked at Wiliam with some horror.

Even, her body shrank back unconsciously.

It seems that Wiliam’s wisdom is even more powerful than her peeping into
heaven!

Between the two, who saw through whom?

Peach Blossom Lady inexplicably put such a question mark in her heart!

She never imagined that her unconscious words could make Wiliam see so many
things!

Naturally, Wiliam’s last sentence was wrong.

Lady Peach Blossom did not euphemistically tell Wiliam the end of her life in this
way.

But what’s the impact?

Join Telegram Group For Fast update

Since Peach Blossom saw the ice master’s soul on Wiliam’s body, she did
subconsciously spy on Wiliam’s future contact with the ice master’s soul.

The results seen are good.

So when Peach Blossom asked Wiliam, she unconsciously chose to tell him.

But what Peach Blossom didn’t expect was that Wiliam had compared the
previous incident.

Pursuing advantages and avoiding disadvantages is indeed the attitude of Lady
Peach Blossom towards Wiliam now.

In this round, Peach Blossom did not reveal the secret.

But Wiliam used her skillfully and got the secret.

For a time, Lady Peach Blossom’s heart was complicated.

This kid is too smart!
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How to describe this?

Does this prejudge my prediction?

“What if you guessed wrong? You really don’t want this life?” Peach Blossom
sighed and said to Wiliam.

At this moment, Wiliam’s face was a little grim.

However, he still laughed and said: “First of all, I still have confidence in seeing
people. And even if it’s wrong, so what? Isn’t there a fifty percent chance? What
is there to be afraid of in life and death?”

Seeing Wiliam’s ferocious yet righteous appearance, Lady Peach Blossom was
speechless.

What the hell has this kid gone through?

She really wanted to use her abilities again, but it was Wiliam’s past.

But abruptly held back.

The more you count on this kid, the more clearly you will not know.

On the contrary, this kid will use various ways to unknowingly make out the
words.

The more Wiliam knows, the more unfavorable it is for him.

“Thank you grandmother! Take care of Feng Xue for me.” As if unable to bear
anything, Wiliam squeezed out these words through gritted teeth.

Then, with a bang in his head, he didn’t know anything.

And he naturally didn’t hear it. After he lost his mind, the grandmother said
quietly: “Boy, do you know that your hope in this life is based on having me
protect you…”

At this moment, Wiliam, after losing his mind, seemed to have entered another
new world.

What he was walking on was a thousand miles of scorched earth.

Above his head is the Nine Suns Burning World!

In front of him, there was a sea of ​ ​ corpses and blood that could not see the
end.



Behind him, there is a constant war crying.

Such a desolate and dreary picture was presented in front of Wiliam in such an
instant.

He saw that among those corpses, there were beasts the size of mountains, and
there were also humans like him.

Is it an ancient battlefield…

Wiliam muttered silently in his heart.

The war between beasts and people, could it be the time when the three
ancestors were allied together, the Eight Desolates and the Four Emperors…

Wiliam was deeply shocked by the tragic picture of the war in front of him.

But at this time, the mountain of corpses and blood in front of him suddenly
moved.

The whole earth, as if it had life, actually began to rise and fall, breathing.

After a while, the mountain of corpses and the sea of ​ ​ blood in front of
Wiliam’s eyes seemed to be pushed open by something.

A desolate and majestic voice came to Wiliam’s ear from there, “Children, are you
trying to steal my soul?”

Wiliam gradually saw that an inhuman being stood up among the piles of corpses.

The height of this thing is five meters high!

Moreover, this thing has a human body, but its face is like a bull’s head, with four
eyes on it, and dark horns on its head!

Even his feet were like hooves.

Not only that, he also has six hands, and his ears are like swords and halberds,
and he looks extremely sharp.

What’s even more striking is that he has a pair of extremely black wings on his
back!

Such a hideous appearance, I am afraid that you have to go to hell to see it!

Even when I saw this for the first time, I couldn’t help but take a deep breath!

However, he reacted immediately.



Isn’t this thing the image of Chi You, the ancient soldier?

In his lifetime, to be able to meet the living ancestors of human beings, Wiliam
felt an inexplicable honor in his heart.

After the soldier Chiyou stood up, he shook his body, and some minced meat
suddenly fell from his body.

Then, he sat down on the pile of tall corpses and looked at Wiliam from a
distance.

What does it feel like to be stared at by four eyes?

Wiliam only felt cold all over his body, as if he had been pricked by a needle,
extremely uncomfortable!

“Well, you are actually pregnant with a unicorn old man’s blood and soul!” Chi
You, the soldier leader, suddenly roared as if he had discovered a new world.

This roar, the world seems to tremble!

Wiliam secretly screamed badly.

Chi You is one of the three ancestors of human beings, and Senior Tianqing Qilin
is one of the Eight Desolate and Four Emperors.

Aren’t the two of them absolutely antagonistic protagonists in this time-honored
battle that has changed history!

Chi You smelled the breath of the sky blue unicorn, and was naturally extremely
angry.

Wiliam’s head was a little big for a while.

How can this be done.

“It’s just the remnant soul, it’s not something to be afraid of. Go back to my
question! You will seize my soul and overtake me!” Chi You, the soldier, stared at
Wiliam again.

This time, Wiliam took a deep breath and looked at Chi You’s six eyes!

“It’s not taking your soul, nor is it above you. It’s making a deal with you.” Wiliam
said lightly.

“Trade?” Chi You was actually interested, and crossed his legs again.

“Master Soldier, Tianqing Qilin still has only a little blood essence and remnant
soul, so you must be the same. The soul of Tianqing Qilin’s predecessors can be



nourished and reborn. You must have a way to be reborn, right?” Wiliam thought
for a while, said.

“Are you greedy for my strength, the truth of the unicorn’s resurrection?” Did not
think that Chiyou was not a big fool, and his mind was exquisite.

However, when Wiliam saw this, he breathed a sigh of relief.

I am not afraid that Chi You is too smart, but I am afraid that he is unreasonable…

Do it as soon as you come up, who can stand it!

Being smart means there is room for negotiation.

“No, you have to think so. This remnant of your soul should have been floating
for thousands of years. During this long period of time, have you found a way to
revive? I’m afraid there is no way, otherwise you will not be up to now. It’s just a
remnant of the soul, and even experienced the embarrassing situation of being
found, but not recognized by others.” Wiliam sorted his thoughts and explained
in a eloquent manner.

There was no expression on Chi You’s face, but his legs were more firmly crossed.

Wiliam continued: “And today, you met me, a person who knows goods, someone
who has a way to bring you back to life, are you sure you don’t want to cherish
and cherish me?”

Chi You’s four eyes were fixed on Wiliam, but he didn’t say anything.

And Wiliam tried his best to make his face look calmer, so that he looked like he
had seen some of the world.

In fact, Wiliam’s heart was also very uneasy.

What he said just now, he was pretending to be stupid on purpose.

In front of him is the ancestor of mankind, a generation of soldiers, and he is
even called the evil god!

It is completely possible to say that Chi You are both civil and military.

How could Chiyou not know how to resurrect himself?

It’s just that the conditions are very harsh, and there are very few people who can
help him.

And dealing with such an extremely smart person, Wiliam can’t be too stupid.



If you are too stupid, the other party will simply ignore it and will not take it
seriously.

Being too smart will make the other party more vigilant, and even give up the
transaction directly.

So Wiliam chose a compromise.

Sure enough, after a while, Chi You’s deep voice sounded again, “Continue.”

WhenWiliam came to Chiyou, he calmed down a bit, and said again: “I can enter
here and see you, you should also know that I got a wisp of your remnant soul
dependency. And this remnant soul dependency, The function of warming and
nourishing the soul can only be exerted under the circumstances that I can urge it,
and this must be approved by you.”

“Are you afraid to die?” Chi You suddenly asked this question inexplicably.

Wiliam seemed to have expected it a long time ago, and said with a smile, “I’m
afraid of death, but I also covet the scenery after getting your approval, so I’m
willing to risk everything to see you and get your approval.”

Chi You suddenly burst out laughing, and the whole world trembled.

“I am very ambitious and very happy. I like wild people!”

Wiliam’s eyes were fixed on Chi You, and he felt that this transaction had taken a
step forward.

Wiliam showed his ambition.

This is obviously in line with the disposition of a generation of evil gods.

“There are very few people who can save my soul. There are very few in the world,
and you are one of them. If so, what is the harm if I give you a chance!” Chi You
said with a smile.

Hearing this, Wiliam’s body couldn’t help but straighten up.

He never thought that it would be so easy to get Chi You’s approval.

It won’t be that simple…

It seems that the next step is the biggest test.

“What do I need to do?” Wiliam asked seriously.

Chi You said some difficult old words to Wiliam, and after Wiliam thought about
it, he understood what Chi You meant.



The next step is simple.

Because of Chi You’s soul, even a trace of it was extremely powerful.

There are very few people in the world who can store his remnant soul.

So even if someone got the soul of the soldier, they couldn’t come in here and
face Chi You face to face.

And even if someone came in, but he didn’t get Chi You’s initial approval, if he
wanted to forcibly hold back, there was only a dead end.

Next, Chi You’s soul will enter Wiliam’s divine sea.

As long as Wiliam can carry it down, even if Chi You agrees, he can use the soldier
master to calm his soul at will.

Wiliam was deeply vigilant about this.
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