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Chapter 325: Chapter 325: Do As Mrs. Mu Said 

Although Daisy asked the sales clerks in the mall to ignore her and Edward and go back 
to their normal work, the clerks wouldn't leave them alone. They were Edward's 
employees, so it was his thoughts and orders that mattered most to them. 

"Do as Mrs. Mu said. Get back to work, " Edward said softly. He understood that since 
he scarcely ever turned up in the mall, the employees got nervous to see him there. So 
he didn't act bossy today. He almost never insulted his employees, because he thought 
that would mean that he was a lousy manager. 

"Yes, Mr. Mu." As the CEO of FX International Group, Edward was extremely well-
mannered, but overbearing as well. Few people dared look him in the eye, let alone his 
employees. With Edward's permission, the sales clerks went back to work. They felt 
overwhelmed by his bearing. 

Daisy stood there quietly, tender eyes fixed on Edward. Just as she had surprised 
Edward, she had found her husband had many surprising sides as well. She had always 
thought that the rich and famous tended to look down on ordinary people. She 
discovered that Edward wasn't one of them. He treated everybody equally and thought 
of himself as nothing but a commoner. He didn't discriminate against anyone. These 
were his merits and they appealed to her strongly. Looking at the fashionable clothes 
that she designed herself, Leena couldn't help smiling. 

LN was a fashion brand Leena created. As a rising new star in the fashion world, it had 
enjoyed global popularity in two years' time, standing alongside other popular brands. It 
was lauded for its originality and keen insight in fashion, enjoying a high reputation 
among European aristocrats. It had been taken as a great example of the brands which 
were all the rage at the time in fashion industry. 

One thing that made Leena stand out as a designer was that besides ladies' wear, she 
also designed menswear for cultivated tastes, suitable for many different occasions. 
Leena was confident in her designs and decided to pick a dress of her own design for 
the party tonight. There were several styles of menswear that fitted Kevin perfectly. With 
his outstanding appearance, he would look smart and dashing in them. 

"Leena, are you picking out suits for Kevin?" Seeing her wandering about in the 
menswear zone, Daisy came over. She was curious. 

"Yes, sis. But don't you want to know about something else? My lightning marriage, for 
example." From the way Daisy had asked her, Leena sensed that she knew about their 



marriage. A bright red flush spread over Leena's face, making her more charming than 
ever. 

I just want to say that Kevin is a man of not only good looks but also integrity. You've 
made the right decision, and you won't regret it." Daisy knew Kevin well. Once he made 
the choice, he wouldn't back down, no matter what. 

"Thank you, sis. You're the second person to support me in this matter, " It was true. 
Before Daisy, no one agreed with Leena's decision except for her father. So she had 
started to have doubts about her marriage, although she pretended to be calm. She had 
thought that she might have made a mistake. Daisy's opinion reassured her and 
strengthened her confidence in her marriage. 

"Are there many people who disapprove of your decision?" Daisy smiled faintly. Leena 
had been spoiled since she was a baby girl. Naturally her marriage would arouse a 
great deal of concern. And it was quite normal for the people around her to be angry 
when she didn't ask their permission. Sometimes this concern was annoying, but 
mostly, it was enviable. Daisy, for one, wished there had been someone that cared 
about her so much growing up. 

"That's it. Let's talk about something else. Sis, would you like to choose some clothes 
for Edward? I designed quite a few clothes according to his style, " Leena said. She 
hadn't intended to brag. She just blurted it out. It was too late when she realized it. 

"What? You designed all these?" Daisy asked. She had gotten a weird feeling about 
these clothes, but hadn't known why. It all made sense now. What a surprise! Who 
would expect a muddled girl like Leena to become the designer of a global brand? Like 
they say, the better you feel about yourself, the less you need to show off. 

"Haha, I don't think my designs are good enough, so I was too embarrassed to tell you 
guys. But, me and my big mouth..." Leena gave an embarrassed smile. Leena didn't 
think she was qualified to be ranked among the best designers, so she felt bashful in 
front of Daisy, who was sort of a relative to her. 

"No way! Aunt Leena, did you really design all these clothes yourself? Promise you 
aren't just taking the credit for someone else's work?" Justin happened to hear Leena 
talking as he got closer. He looked at the ornately designed fashionable clothing around 
him and didn't believe careless Leena was the designer. He wouldn't have called her 
aunt if his mom hadn't asked. 

"Well, didn't you refuse to call me aunt just a short time ago? Why have you changed 
your mind? What trick are you up to?" Leena didn't believe Justin had changed his mind 
for no reason. He might be planning to start his sarcasm the next minute. 

"Huh! Do you have a persecution complex? I just heard that you said you designed 
these clothes yourself. Maybe there is really something wrong with my ears. Just think 



about how active you are. Designing is boring. How could you possibly focus on such 
dull work?" Pretending there was really something wrong with his ears, Justin rubbed 
them with a cute facial expression. Leena would have loved him if he hadn't despised 
her so much. 

It's a pity that it is really me who designed them. I'm sorry to disappoint you." Provoked 
by the little boy, Leena answered back sarcastically without thinking and forgot her 
intention to keep a low profile. 

Watching Justin and Leena, Daisy touched her forehead resignedly and wondered why 
they were fighting all the time. Was it so difficult to tolerate each other for them? 

"Duke told me that you created your own brand. So it's LN. It seems that we 
underestimated you. It took up a lot of time and energy for us to become your brand's 
agent. It would have been much easier if I just went through you, " 

Edward said approvingly, leaning on the counter and looking enchanting. He had 
engaged in the negotiation for the agency himself. He had been curious about the 
designer. He had wondered who could be so important as to make him put everything 
aside for his or her luxury brand. Because of either its high quality or the good materials 
it used, LN's price was rather high, higher than its like products. Hence, it was 
considered a luxury brand. 

"Oh. How did Duke know? I didn't tell a soul." Leena frowned in confusion. She had 
been happy that she had done a good job hiding it from everybody. But now it seemed 
Duke had already known about her secret for some time. 

He knows that you created your own fashion brand, but he doesn't know it is LN. He will 
be thrilled if he knows its such a well known brand. He's always proud of you. 

Edward could imagine how happy Duke would be if he knew about it. He always took 
pride in Leena. He was more of a father to her than a big brother. He spoiled her so 
much that he became a different person around her. If Leena hadn't gone abroad to 
study fashion design, he would still be her overprotective brother. 

I was considering giving him a surprise in a few days. Leena patted her chest as she 
was saying this. Seeing her movement, Justin rolled his eyes at her and thought it 
childish and stupid. God, how could you let a befuddled and evil woman like Leena 
become fashion designer? Maybe you are just as muddled as she is, thought Justin. 

Chapter 326: Chapter 326: I Have Better Things To Do 

The Mu's changed plans because Leena suddenly joined them. Daisy had a fever last 
night, and Edward didn't want to wear her out by doing too much walking. After Leena 
had picked up a suit for Kevin, instead of continuing their shopping excursion, they 
found a cafe to rest, which was exactly what Justin wanted. 



"How do you feel? Are you tired?" As soon as they sat down, Edward asked worriedly, 
face full of concern. It looked like he really cared about Daisy. 

"I'm okay. I'm not a fragile doll. I am a soldier, okay?" Daisy wouldn't be a fearless 
colonel in the army if she was easily beaten by a small fever. Everyone in the army was 
iron-blooded, including Daisy herself. 

"What's wrong, sis? Are you sick? Did you get Tom to have a look? Tell you what, Tom 
is a genius doctor!" Leena noticed Daisy's pale face right after she saw her, but she 
thought it might be due to the lighting in the mall. It turned out Daisy was not feeling 
well! 

"Yes. I'm fine now, thanks to Tom." When she mentioned Tom's name, Daisy suddenly 
blushed. Memories of seducing Edward that morning flashed through her mind. She 
became a little nervous as if everyone knew what she had done. 

Edward immediately picked up on what Daisy was thinking about as he saw her rosy 
cheeks. It was the very first time that Daisy had ever tried to seduce him! Damn Tom, 
barging in on them! And Daisy wouldn't let him continue even if he had driven Tom 
away. Edward swore that he would make Tom pay for that. 

"Right? Tom is famous for his excellent medical skills. You can trust him! But geniuses 
are always unpredictable; he chooses his own patients rather than the other way 
around." Leena complained to Daisy with a frown. Tom wouldn't care if his patient was 
the mayor as long as he didn't feel like treating anyone. But Leena guessed Tom acted 
like this because he could! However, Leena was surprised that Tom had never turned 
down Edward, and he almost showed up instantly after Edward called him. How 
peculiar! 

"Really? I'm flattered." Daisy had only met Tom twice, including last night. So she had 
no idea how brilliant a doctor Tom was. She used to think he was just one of Edward's 
friends who happened to be a doctor. But he seemed so gentle and approachable. Was 
he really unpredictable like Leena said? 

"He should be flattered. He got the chance to meet a colonel. Not something that 
happens every day, " snorted Edward coldly. He hadn't forgiven Tom for interrupting his 
romantic moment with Daisy, how could he ever admit that Tom was a genius doctor at 
this point? The only thing he could do was to try not to trash him too much, for he did 
cure Daisy after all. 

"Wow! Edward, are you jealous?" Upon hearing Edward's sour comment, Leena 
couldn't help snickering. She had never seen Edward green with jealousy like this. She 
made a point of mentioning it in front of Daisy. 

"Jealous? Me? He's not that brilliant, okay? He's just some ordinary doctor!" Although 
Edward was impressed by Tom's medical skills, he would never admit it in front of 



Daisy. He wouldn't allow her to think that there were other men who were as brilliant or 
even more brilliant than him. 

Daisy cast a curious look at Edward, wondering since when Edward started to trash talk 
his friend? Why would a mature man like him act so childish? Daisy was puzzled, 
having no inkling what Edward was thinking. 

"Humph! It's just sour grape! Why did you let him treat sis if you think he's merely 
average?" Leena seemed to pick on Edward's words today, which confused Edward. 
'Did something happen? Leena seems strange.' pondered Edward. 

"Because he's the only doctor I know. Who else could I call? You? I'd better stick with 
Tom. We're talking about saving lives! You may kill somebody if I call you instead." 
Edward sipped in his coffee while gazing at Leena. The smirk on his face annoyed 
Leena. 'He must be making fun of me on purpose!' Leena felt like punching Edward all 
of a sudden. 

But instead she banged the table and pouted, "You are bullying me as well! Humph! I'm 
going home!" Leena stood up abruptly. Not just little Justin, but Edward as well! Edward 
used to be fond of her! Leena felt so heartbroken and decided to leave first. 

Leena, ignore them. They're crazy. Please stay." Daisy rolled her eyes at Edward and 
hastily grabbed Leena's hand, trying to make her stay for a while longer. 'What's wrong 
with Edward? Doesn't he adore Leena? Why is he so mean to her today?' Daisy was 
confused. Surprised, Edward and Justin looked at each other with their eyes wide open. 
Did Daisy just blame them for bullying Leena? And she said they were crazy? It was just 
a small joke on Leena! Did she really have to turn against her husband and son? 

"Never mind. I'm too generous to hold a grudge against them. I'll see you tonight, sis. I'll 
need a spa first!" Leena smiled sweetly at Daisy and said goodbye to them. Her words 
puzzled Daisy. 'Again? What's it so special about tonight? Why everyone keeps telling 
me that they'll see me tonight?' Daisy thought to herself as she saw Leena leave 
cheerfully. 

Let's go. We should get back as well. There are a lot of preparations to be done before 
it gets dark." Edward noticed Daisy's perplexed look; but he simply smiled and said 
nothing. He would save the answer for later. 

Preparations? What do you mean? Are you keeping something from me? Why is 
everybody acting strange and saying they'll see me tonight? What day is it today?" 
Daisy looked right into Edward's eyes, as if she wanted to find the answer on his 
handsome face. 

"Don't stare at me like that, honey. You have no idea what that means. We couldn't be 
that bold even if you really want me here. We're not in our bedroom after all." Edward 
leaned forward to whisper in Daisy's ear, his breath brushing her earlobe. Daisy 



shuddered all over and blushed. When she realized what Edward had just said, she 
immediately kicked him on his calf. Damn it! Did he just flirt with her in public? How 
shameless! 

"Ouch! Daisy! Are you trying to kill me?" Daisy caught him off-guard again! How could 
he forget about this? She had done this to him before! And she kicked him really hard 
this time. 'It must be bruised now, ' Edward thought gloomily. 

Justin glared at his father and said nothing. Although Edward had leaned forward to 
make sure only Daisy could hear him, sitting right next to them, Justin heard him too. 
And he felt no sympathy for his father. 

"I don't break laws and commit murders. Besides, I have better things to do than kill 
you." Daisy shrugged with a sneer. However, when she saw the agony on Edward's 
face, she became worried, 'Does it really hurt that much? I didn't kick him that hard.' 
Daisy just wanted to give him some punishment for flirting with her in public; she didn't 
mean to injure him. 

Edward froze as he heard Daisy's words. Why did his wife constantly pick on him 
today? Was she bored of him? That probably explained her strange behavior. 

"Woman, are you trashing me?" Edward narrowed his eyes, which was a sign of 
danger; his eyes glowed with a spark of rage. Maybe he was too good to Daisy lately, 
and she seemed to forget who she was! 

"I'm not trashing you. I'm just ignoring you. Come on, aren't we leaving? Or do you want 
me to kick you again?" Ignoring Edward's warning, Daisy retorted with a smirk and 
walked away without any hesitation. She would have been intimidated by his devilish 
look; however, he didn't scare her anymore! She knew he wouldn't do anything to her 
no matter how angry he got. And the reason was simple: Because he loved her. 

"Haha!" Justin snickered while casting a sensitive look at his father. 'Don't blame me, 
daddy. If I side with you, mommy will definitely punish me and have me do 100 push-
ups! Sorry!' Justin stuck his tongue out and hurried to follow Daisy. 

Edward finally understood that he had been abandoned by both his wife and his son. 
Seeing them walk towards the front gate without even looking back at him, Edward felt 
distressed. Were they so sure that he would follow without any complaint? And yes, of 
course he would. But that was not the point! Eventually, Edward smiled while shaking 
his head, and quickly strode forward to keep up with them. He had no choice but to give 
in, because he loved them too much. 

1 

Chapter 327: Chapter 327: It's You Mary 



It was bound to be a remarkable night in S City tonight. All the senior executives from 
different companies gathered in the most luxurious Kate Hotel to attend the anniversary 
ceremony of the FX International Group. The exceptionally grand occasion was 
unprecedented in S City. It was the most important business party wherein 
businessmen could seize the opportunity to create numerous hidden business 
opportunities. Many people felt lucky and excited about attending the ceremony, 
because in the next second, the chance of being a millionaire could fall for them. 

The Kate Hotel belonged to the FX International Group and was the only six-star hotel 
in S City. It occupied a land of 300 acres, adjacent to a diversified virgin?forest park. 
The surrounding area was a variety of shops and commercial office buildings. The 
transportation in the vicinity was very convenient. The hotel boasted of spacious and 
brightly lit hotel rooms, along with the unique combination of European concept and 
Chinese style in interior design. The hotel left a deep impression on its guests with its 
grandeur, while simultaneously making them feel at home. The guests could also enjoy 
the convenient communication, audio-visual entertainment system, and wireless 
broadband network. 

Beautiful ladies and luxurious cars were typical for any party. When the sunset gradually 
faded from the horizon and the street lights began to light up the sky, luxurious cars 
swarmed in. As the acting CEO of the Lin Group, Jessica was among the guest list. In 
the past, she always walked haughtily in her high heels while holding Edward's arm as 
they entered the hotel. But this time, she came alone and kept a low profile. 

Due to the pregnancy, her waist had become a little round. But it hadn't affected her 
overall attractive image. She intentionally chose a strapless evening dress that made 
her figure look more impressive, especially her plump breasts. Her alluring breasts 
danced along with her pace, as if they would fall out any time. Jessica triggered all the 
men's imagination with her slip skirt. Glimpses of her legs underneath gave a hint of 
sexy appeal with her every step. It was unquestionable that such a gorgeous woman 
would be a stunner in the eyes of men. Standing at the entrance of Kate Hotel, she had 
to take a deep breath to conceal her abjection. What a ridiculous turn of events! At the 
same time last year, she swaggered past all the women that Edward had abandoned 
before. But now, she was the one thrown out of the game. She couldn't accept this fact. 

Oh! Who might this be? It turns out to be the famous Jessica Lin! " As soon as Jessica 
paused at the entrance, someone's mocking voice rang loudly. Jessica inadvertently 
frowned and wondered who would be so bold as to intentionally add insult to injury. 

"Oh, it's you, Mary." Jessica felt reluctant to keep company with people like Mary who 
had humble origins. So when she saw Mary's ostentatious attire, she wasn't inclined to 
chat with her. 

"Yes, it's me. Why do you seem so surprised? As far as I know, you've become the 
woman of Edward's past. I wonder what gives you the courage to attend such a grand 
party? Don't you fear losing face in public?" Mary stroked her hair coquettishly and 



narrowed her eyes at Jessica. She could feel the contempt in Jessica's eyes towards 
her. Jessica was just another woman whom Edward had abandoned. How could she 
still be so arrogant? 

"Don't be ridiculous. Why should I fear losing face? No one knows who the final winner 
is. While you, Mary, you can't even get a chance to touch Edward's sleeves. Don't deny 
that you have feelings for Edward, " Jessica sneered. Beneath her delicate face covered 
with heavy makeup, her heart was filled with the intense desire to tear Mary's foul mouth 
apart. 

"Ha! Jessica, don't tell me that you still have an ace up your sleeve. You can't get 
Edward back even with the child in your womb. What else do you have?" Mary raised 
her chin smugly. If the Lin Group hadn't suffered the financial crisis, Jessica might have 
the nerve to challenge Mary. Since the Lin Group was on the verge of bankruptcy, Mary 
wondered what Jessica could use against her. 

"Mary, don't you find yourself ridiculous? We've never interacted before. Why do you 
keep pestering me?" Jessica raised her head and received curious gazes from other 
guests. She bit her lip, her face turning red with anger. Mary's words hit home, and she 
was heartbroken with this fact. Edward refused to get back with her despite her 
pregnancy. Even worse, he had become more indifferent to her. She didn't know what 
else she could do to win him back. 

Huh! Yes, you're right, we've never interacted, but your haughty behavior in the past 
has been a constant eyesore. The sight of you is offending." Mary detested it when 
other people intentionally displayed their superiority in front of her. She always felt 
insecure in the face of Jessica's arrogance. Most importantly, she felt extremely jealous 
that Jessica had enjoyed Edward's affections for so many years. 

"You're crazy, Mary. I'm warning you, you'd better not provoke me tonight. I think you 
don't need me to remind you, you know how I deal with things. You and I are the same 
kind, so you can imagine what to expect if you dare anger me." Jessica was a woman 
with not just beautiful looks. She was more clever than Mary. She could easily figure out 
what was on Mary's mind. 

"You're fucking crazy. Jessica, if we weren't at this place, I would make you pay for your 
insults. As you've said, you and I are the same kind. I would never do anything that 
would make me lose." Although Mary was usually oblivious, she didn't dare to make a 
scene on the land that belonged to the FX International Group. She decided to remain 
silent in the face of Jessica's challenge. 

The unpleasant confrontation didn't affect the ambiance of the party that was about to 
begin. But it definitely planted deeper hostility between the two women. Nevertheless, 
they got into contact frequently since then, leading to a partnership between the two. 
They would eventually regret this because their partnership would lead to a bigger 
mistake. Compared to the two antagonistic women, Brian looked carefree in his seat. 



He attended the party for the purpose of seeing Daisy. Since he heard that Daisy had 
gotten married to the CEO of the FX International Group, he had been looking for a 
chance to find out why Daisy refused to recognize him. He also wanted to know if Daisy 
was happy with her current life. As long as Daisy was happy, he didn't care if Daisy still 
remembered him or not. 

Because he lived overseas and he didn't have many acquaintances in the country, few 
people in the party knew him. He sat alone in a corner, carefree and unnoticed by 
anyone. His solitude allowed him to overhear conversations he shouldn't have heard. 

"Have you heard? Apparently, Mr. Mu has become a faithful man from a womanizing 
playboy! He has lavished his affections on the mother of their lovechild. There's also 
word that he will introduce the mysterious woman to the public tonight." Women were 
always purveyors of gossips, but at the same time, they were also the victims of 
gossips. 

"Oh no, that's impossible! I heard that that woman looks shabby and is of humble 
origins. Is it suitable for her to appear at such a grand occasion? Apparently, she's not 
as beautiful as Mr. Mu's ex-girlfriend Jessica." As several noble ladies heatedly 
discussed among themselves, Brian started to look concerned. His eyebrows furrowed 
in disapproval and he became furious at the news. 

Edward, how dare you hurt my sister and bring your lover to such an important 
occasion? This is a big insult to her. Do you really think that she has no one to back her 
in her family, that you can willfully break her heart? Don't forget that I'm here to support 
her. No matter what happens, I will never let you hurt her, ' Brian thought in rage. 

"Who knows? This is only hearsay. But one thing's for sure, Mr. Mu really loves the 
woman. Otherwise, how could he change to a completely different person? Besides, it's 
been a long time since the last time there was news about him with a woman. Maybe 
this woman will become his wife because they have a son." The gossip continued, while 
Brian had completely lost his cool. His handsome and bright face was flaming with rage. 

That bastard. It seemed that Edward was treating his sister as if she was invisible. How 
dare he keep such a dirty affair with another woman! He's gone too far. Besides, wasn't 
Daisy a female soldier? Why would she keep silent at such a vicious man's insult? 
Wasn't sabotaging a military marriage a criminal offense? Why would Daisy let Edward 
bring his lover and his lovechild into their home and not do anything about it? 

Brian smiled painfully at the thought. It seemed that god didn't bless good people. 
Otherwise, why would he make his sister endure so much sadness and pain? No 
wonder she was reluctant to recognized him that day. She probably didn't want him to 
know about her painful life. That was why she had firmly stated that she didn't know 
him. 



Brian closed his eyes in agony. When he open them again, there was firm determination 
in his eyes. He couldn't help Daisy to get out of her distressful life in the past, but from 
now on, Brian would officially declare war against Edward. He'd better not die soon, 
Brian would definitely make his life full of surprises. 

Chapter 328: Chapter 328: Soul Of Tears 

As night fell, the Kate Hotel started being filled with celebrities. The upper-class ladies 
were all dressed to kill and constantly evaluating each other's luxurious attire. After 
glancing around the large crowd of elite men present, the rich girls instantly knew their 
backgrounds and assets quite well. Keen on finding the perfect match for themselves, 
they desperately wanted to earn the favor of the certain rich men who were known for 
their handsome looks and financial status. But none of them had shown up yet, even 
when the party started. No wonder the women were a bit disappointed. 

While the women hunted for the perfect husband, the men were glancing around to 
check the female party guests. They were all dazzled at the sight of Jessica who wore a 
long revealing gown. Her big breasts aroused their wildest fantasies. They had been 
longing to get an eyeful of her curvy figure for a long time. But with Edward at her side, 
they dared not stare at her. Today, they could finally feast their eyes on her. Despite 
how attracted they were, no man stepped forward to flirt with her. After all, Edward 
hadn't announced their break-up. They didn't want to cross Edward and risk their 
company for a woman. So they remained in place and continued fantasizing without 
taking any action. 

Seeing Jessica in the limelight made Mary huff angrily. She intentionally chose an 
elegant and conservative dress to impress Edward, but every man's eyes were glued on 
Jessica's captivating figure. Not even the slightest bit of attention shifted to her. It 
seemed her orthodox outfit was her biggest mistake tonight. 

In contrast to Mary's regret, Jessica was quite delighted with all the attention. As if on 
purpose, she stroked the precious 'Soul of Tears' necklace several times around her 
neck. It was a present from Edward. She wanted to wear the necklace as a reminder of 
her place in Edward's heart. She smiled and moved gracefully, exhibiting her charm and 
allure. She was determined to win over Daisy tonight, then Edward would see who was 
the perfect woman to stand by him. 

The story behind the 'Soul of Tears' necklace had widely circulated in the upper-class 
society. It was difficult to forget indeed. After all, Edward paid ten times the original price 
for the necklace, just to make Jessica happy. His generous purchase made the 
headlines in S City, bringing quite a lot of readers to outlets and plenty of pride for 
Jessica. But things had changed. A lot had disappeared, including Edward's affections 
for her. 

Jessica strode through the hall and glanced around, but didn't find the figure she was 
looking for. A trace of displeasure crept up her face. But she remembered that Edward 



usually came to these events late. Of course, he wouldn't be here yet. As she roamed 
the room, she felt a pair of harsh eyes boring into her. But when looking around, she 
didn't find anything amiss. 

Jessica's senses were right. Someone was glaring at her figure the whole time, more 
precisely, at her stomach. It was as if the observer was trying to check if she was really 
carrying a baby. The observer didn't even blink her eyes, she didn't want to miss a 
thing. Then, she started wondering if Jessica's shoes were a bit too high for a pregnant 
woman. 

"You're not even looking at where you're going, " Duke complained. Belinda was too 
busy staring at Jessica to pay any attention to herself. She didn't take back her gaze 
until she almost tripped over her dress. But luckily, Duke caught her in his arms. In her 
lavender trailing gown, Belinda looked noble and elegant. She emanated strength, 
beauty, and innocence as she walked through the crowd. 

"Thank you!" Belinda immediately pulled out of Duke's arms. She was still mad at him. 
With her problem with Duke in mind, she wasn't in the mood to ask Daisy how she was 
doing after her return from the military exercises. This was why she arrived at the party 
so early, to see Daisy as soon as possible. She wanted to check if the tension between 
her and Edward had diminished. But her goal was stalled once again. 

"Belinda, do you have to act so indifferent towards me? You should at least tell me what 
I did wrong before you shut me off." With Rachel's harassment and Belinda's anger, 
things had been tough for Duke recently. Now, Belinda even stopped preparing for the 
wedding that they had been planning together, and he couldn't figure out why. 

"You did nothing wrong. It's me. I'm just not in a good mood." Belinda answered 
hesitantly. Her tone showed her reluctance. She was mad at him and Rachel. She knew 
about their history. Although she didn't mind their romantic past, it didn't mean that she 
could just accept this self-important woman waltzing into her life. She couldn't believe 
that Duke was over Rachel. If he didn't have feelings for her anymore, he would've 
deleted her number. But he still kept her number in his phone. It could only mean that 
he still liked her. Why else would he put up with her harassment? She really hated the 
way his phone rang endlessly in the past several days. Every time it rang, Duke 
purposefully hung up in front of her. What was he trying to prove? 

Have I ever told you that you're a terrible liar?" Duke fixed his cold eyes on her. He had 
enough of her surly and odd behavior in the past several days. He wanted to discuss 
their problems, instead of pushing them aside. 

"You have to let me go first." Noticing that they were gaining some attention, Belinda 
was embarrassed to stay in Duke's arms. After all, only close friends knew about their 
marriage. She didn't want to make their relationship public and become the topic of 
gossip in S City. 



"What if I say no?" Duke looked up, meeting the women's shocked eyes. They should 
be surprised. After all, he never flirted with or approached any woman, let alone display 
his affections in public. 

"If you want to be tomorrow's headline, then hold me as long as you want." Knowing 
how much Duke hated exposure, Belinda used it against him. 

"I wouldn't care about being on the news if you're with me." Duke curled his lips into a 
mischievous smile, winning the hearts of all the women present. Duke was no less 
popular than Edward, but nobody ever flirted with him due to his indifference. No matter 
how many woman wanted him, his cold eyes instantly extinguished any idea about 
approaching him. They wouldn't even dare to talk to him. 

Chapter 329: Chapter 329: Are You Jealous (part one) 

"Yo! I was wondering who are engaging in a public display of affection here. Edward 
and Daisy aren't here yet; isn't it too early to steal the spotlight?" Rain casually 
approached Duke and Belinda and teased them with his eyebrows raised. He was 
wearing a gray suit, exquisitely tailored. 

Rain had been calling Annie ever since she disappeared after that night. He felt 
distressed when her family told him that she wanted to be left alone for a while. He 
finally stopped trying to track her down. He believed that Annie would come back to him 
if she really loved him! And he would wait patiently until she did. The earth is round. 
Even though they parted here and headed different ways, they would eventually meet 
again someday somewhere if they were meant to be together. If Annie didn't love him, 
there would be no point in finding her. We can't force people to love us. And there would 
only be endless sorrow and pain for people who were thrown together in a loveless 
relationship. 

"What? Are you jealous?" Duke retorted sourly, rolling his eyes. 'What's wrong with 
him? Can't he see that I'm in the middle of a conversation with my wife? What's he 
doing here?' Duke was annoyed. 

"Yes! I'm jealous to death! Okay, I'll leave you two alone and spread my charm over 
there. Go back to whatever you were doing." Rain put on a devil-may-care smile in front 
of everyone, but he was breaking down inside. It seemed every one of his friends had 
someone to love, someone who loved them, except for him! 

"Fuck off! No wonder Annie left you! Look at yourself, fluttering around like a butterfly!" 
Duke was pissed. He was in the middle of something really romantic and intimate with 
Belinda. And Rain had ruined everything! How could they continue after being 
interrupted? 

"Don't you know? I'm helping them out! Look at all those pretty girls. They'll wither 
without my love!" Rain folded his arms in front of his chest and leaned against the pillar. 



He wore his signature smirk; his amethyst ear studs flickered as he turned his head 
toward a gaggle of girls standing nearby. With the complete package, he looked 
dangerously irresistible. Almost every girl around forgot to breathe and could only stare 
blankly into his charming face. 

"That's bullshit! You'll only hurt them in the end. Stop bragging, you jerk!" Belinda had 
realized that she and Duke drew too much attention; now that Rain joined the party and 
made things even worse! This man didn't know how to spell the word 'low-key' -- he only 
knew how to call attention to himself! Almost every woman's gaze was riveted where 
they stood. 

"Belinda! You wound me! Hurt them? Nonsense! You should worry more about me. I'm 
the one who has to attend to the needs of all these lovely women!" Rain pretentiously 
brushed his hair with his fingers and winked at Belinda, who shuddered all over and 
wanted to throw up all of a sudden. No wonder they said Rain never played by the rules! 
They were arguing and he was suddenly being flirtatious? Belinda was in shock. 

"Oh cut the crap! Look! there's a...um...larger lady over there, and she's been checking 
you out since you got here. Why don't you go after her?" Belinda raised her eyebrows 
and gestured towards the woman in question with her head. 

Rain had just taken a glass of champagne from the waiter with the tray; he spurted out 
the liquid and coughed violently as he heard Belinda, his eyes full of disbelief. He had 
underestimated her! How could she even make such a disgusting proposal no matter 
how much she hated him? 

"What the hell are you doing? I swear I'll kill you right now!" Duke furrowed his brows as 
he glared at the beads of champagne on his suit, and then Rain's face. Why on earth 
was he always the one to get run into, or have a drink spilled on? So unlucky! Why did 
Rain spurt liquid like this? Did he think himself a sprinkler? 

"Hey, it's not my fault! Blame your wife! She wants me to sleep with that woman! Have 
you even seen her face? I'd rather die!" Rain shuddered. Come on! If he really slept with 
that woman, he wouldn't be able to recover from that for the rest of his life. He might 
even become impotent and lose interest in all women. 

Duke was curious and looked in the direction Rain was pointing. His face twitched at the 
sight. 'Damn it! Why should I care what he saw?' Duke knew he should have just 
ignored Rain. The woman misunderstood them, and she even winked at Duke as he 
turned around. Duke felt like he was going to have a heart attack! 

"Do you two have to act like this? She is just a tiny bit plus-sized, with heavy make-up, 
and a unique style. Everything else seems fine!" Belinda held back the urge to burst into 
laughter and blurted out random sentences with a serious tone. The corners of her lips 
were twitching because she really wanted to laugh out loud. 



"Belinda, are you serious? Do you even know what you are saying? Plus-sized? She's 
twice as big as I am! Just imagine how much pressure she's putting on the earth. And 
look at her make-up! We're at a party, not the theater! And what else? Oh, a unique 
style? Listen to yourself! I didn't say fat is ugly, but she have to wear a skin tight dress 
like that? You know what? I'm terrified by the thought that her dress will pop open any 
second! 

Rain blurted out without stopping, in the end, he even shivered violently. 

Duke felt exactly the same. He cast a curious look at Belinda, wondering what was 
wrong with her. She sounded calm and sincere as she described the woman just now, 
as if the woman was just some plain and ordinary female rather than a hideous 
monster. 

 


