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Chapter 2966 
Jackie was incredibly curious as he looked at the alchemists from the two other worlds. 
He noticed that, compared to the stronger Chaos Continent, the alchemists from the 
White Marsh Continent seemed a lot prouder of themselves. 

They looked at the alchemists from Hestia Continent with looks that were full of disdain, 
especially the alchemist that stood in front of all of them. Jackie knew that person. It 
was Ethan, who had mocked them through the image earlier. He was the leader of the 
alchemists from White Marsh Continent. 

To not stir any unnecessary trouble, Jackie remained standing at the end of Hestia 
Continent’s group. 

Right after the voice announced that the tournament would only start after two hours, 
Ethan had a look of impatience on his face. After a while, he actually shouted, “There’s 
no need to prepare at all. Why do we need to wait for so long? Just start right now. After 
getting the golden treasure, I still have a lot more things I need to do.” 

He sounded quite arrogant and sure that he would definitely get the golden treasure. 
His words had even offended the alchemists from the Chaos Continent. 

The one standing in front of the alchemists from Chaos Continent turned to coldly look 
at Ethan, “You’re not that skilled, but you sure have a lot to say. You claimed that you 
would definitely get the golden treasure as if you’re the best in the world.” 

Ethan’s face darkened. He absolutely hated anyone who spoke back to him. No matter 
how unreasonable he was being, he did not want anyone talking back 

He turned to look at who seemed like the leader of the Chaos Continent’s alchemists, 
and coldly said, “I might not be considered the best, but I can obviously get the golden 
treasure if I’m competing against trash like you. You were just here to make up the 
numbers! Emilio Lawrence, we’ve known each other for so many years. I know very well 
how strong you are. Don’t think that I’ll look at you better just because you said that, and 
think that you can snatch the golden treasure away from me!” 

At that moment, the atmosphere was incredibly heated. He was practically slapping 
Emilio in the face. Emilio might not be someone who liked unnecessary trouble, but he 
would not let someone just bully him like that either. 

Emilio narrowed his eyes, “We definitely have known each other for many years, and I 
know that you have a few tricks up your sleeves as well. That’s why I don’t have to hear 
you brag! I heard that you’re so pleased with yourself that you even transferred your 
image to Hestia Continent. All you’re good for is bragging in front of them. In Chaos 



Continent, you would just be a slightly talented alchemist. You would have nothing to 
brag about at all!” 

Ethan’s face reddened when he heard that, and turned around to point at Emilio, “All I’m 
doing is speaking the truth, you just don’t want to admit it. That’s why you’re lying and 
saying that I’m bragging. All of you were just here to make up the numbers. Do you 
think you’re worthy of taking the golden treasure away from me?” 

If not for the laws that were in place, the two of them could have very well started 
fighting. The atmosphere between the two continents started to get more and more 
heated. Comparatively, Hestia Continent’s side was a lot quieter. 

Emilio’s words had not only mocked Ethan, but had insulted Hestia Continent as well. It 
was possible that, in those people’s eyes, Hestia Continent was trash, and Hestia 
Continent were the ones who were really just there to make up the numbers. 

Chapter 2967 
Nash took a deep breath as his face reddened a little. 

He was suffering from the humiliation, but there was nothing he could say. After all, the 
difference in skill was on full display for everyone to see. There was nothing he could 
say that could change that. However, even if he knew that he could not compare to the 
two other worlds, he still suffered hearing what was said. 

Someone frowned and said, “This is crossing the line. Even if we can’t compete for the 
golden or bronze treasures, we should still be able to at least fight for the black 
treasure. I feel that Nash is capable enough!” 

After that person finished, the others nodded immediately. They knew very well that 
Hestia Continent would not be able to fight for the top two places, but they were still 
hopeful for the last prize. After all, it was not like they had never gotten the black 
treasure before. Nash was also an alchemist from the Scarlet Pavilion, so he must be 
talented and skilled. Otherwise, there was no way he could have been an alchemist at a 
ninth-grade clan! 

Nash frowned, not saying anything. He was strangely quiet. The argument on the other 
side got more and more intense. No one wanted to give way. Even though White Marsh 
Continent could not compete with the Chaos Continent, Ethan felt like he was quite 
good. 

He felt like he could defeat all of the other alchemists in this round, so he was acting 
very prideful. No matter what Emilio said, Nash would retort with even more, so they 
started to argue. 

Ethan crossed his arms and said, “I wasn’t doing that at all, I was just trying to tell 
Hestia Continent to not waste their Lime. Was I wrong? It’s not like you don’t know how 



bad Hestia Continent is. I’m just giving them advice out of the goodness of my heart. It’s 
their fault for not wanting to accept my kindness!” 

Emilio snorted as he said in disdain, “Just say that you’re showing off, no need to 
pretend to be kind. If you really were trying to be kind, how could they not accept it? 
Why don‘t you turn around to ask those alchemists from Hestia Continent how they feel 
about your words?!” 

Ethan said, “I don’t care what they feel. I just have to know that I really was trying to be 
kind. They’re the ones who don‘t know their place and insist on participating! They won’t 
admit that they’re trash. After all, trash usually tends to not be self-ware!” 

The two of them were actually starting to insult Hestia Continent more and more as they 
argued. Ethan started to hold back less and less, and Hestia Continent’s alchemists 
really wanted to slap the two of them. 

The alchemists from Hestia Continent were about to lose control. Ethan really was 
crossing the line. When they were in the inner city, the communications he had sent 
over were just pure mockery, how could it be out of kindness? 

He was deliberately trying to twist things around, even presenting himself as a good 
person. Even Jackie was feeling the anger. That person was way too disgusting. 

Nash took a deep breath and finally took a step forward. After all, he was the leader of 
the alchemists from Hestia Continent. If he was forced to just swallow everything, even 
the alchemists from Hestia Continent would start to look down on him. 

Nash looked up and said, “The rules are clear for all to see, so why can‘t we 
participate? We’ve even gotten treasures before. If all of the alchemists from Hestia 
Continent are trash, then there’s no way we could have gotten two treasures. One of 
them is even a bronze treasure!” 

Nash said that to defend Hestia Continent’s honor. In truth, his words were completely 
reasonable, it was not like all of the alchemists from Hestia Continent were trash. 

Chapter 2968 
If they really were all trash, then how could they have gotten any treasures? 

Yet, the moment he said that Ethan started to laugh in a very exaggerated manner. He 
turned to coldly look at Nash, “You only got two treasures, how did you even have the 
face to say that? Have you ever gotten any golden treasures? You haven’t gotten a 
single one! White Marsh Continent has gotten two golden treasures, one bronze 
treasure, and three black treasures! Hestia Continent only has two treasures in total and 
not a single golden one. You‘re actually saying you’re not trash?” 



“Who else would be trash if not you? Based on what I know, those two treasures are 
already the limit of what Hestia Continent will be able to get. In the following few groups, 
you‘ll definitely return empty-handed. It‘s precisely because of that, that I asked that you 
do not waste your time. You’re such an eyesore!” 

After Ethan said that, the other alchemists from White Marsh Continent behind him 
started to laugh as well. They looked at Hestia Continent with mocking gazes. 

Jackie could not help but frown when he heard all of that. Ethan’s words did not seem to 
just be mockery, Jackie had heard something else from it as well. It was as if Ethan 
knew about Hestia Continent’s situation very clearly, like someone was giving him 
reports. 

After Ethan said all of that, he still did not want to let Hestia Continent off. He felt like 
Nash trying to uphold Hestia Continent’s honor was a challenge to him, so how could 
Ethan let him off easily? 

Ethan snorted lightly as he walked over. 

All of Hestia Continent’s alchemists frowned at the same time as they looked at him in 
alarm, despite the fact that everyone knew that there was no way Ethan could attack 
them thanks to the restrictions. However, Ethan obviously looked like he did not harbor 
any good intentions. 

Sure enough, after he walked over, he pushed Nash aside and looked right at Jackie. 

He pointed right at Jackie’s alchemist badge and said, “I told you! You were all trash! 
You really are here to make up the numbers. You refused to admit it but just look at this 
person. Look at what’s on his chest!” 

As he said that, Ethan deliberately raised his voice, letting everyone their hear him 
clearly. After that, he purposely moved aside, pointing at Jackie’s alchemist badge. 

At that moment the alchemists from the two other worlds all saw the sixth-grade 
alchemist badge on Jackie’s chest. 

“He‘s actually a sixth-grade alchemist. It looks like Hestia Continent has really run out of 
people. It’s only the seventh group, but do they not have enough people anymore? They 
don‘t even have any more seventh-grade alchemists left?” 

Even the alchemists from the Chaos Continent joined in to mock them this time. 
Everyone looked at the alchemists from Hestia Continent with looks full of disdain. 

Jackie’s sixth- grade alchemist badge really did make it seem like he was just here to 
make up the numbers. 



Jackie’s lips twitched as he was rendered speechless, suddenly regretting not getting a 
change of clothes. He had never cared about it but did not want to waste his time on 
those people and cause himself any trouble either. He had thought that no one would 
notice him if he was at the end of the group, but Ethan had actually rushed over and 
pushed everyone aside to point him out. It was as if Ethan already knew everything that 
happened in the inner city. 

Jackie frowned as he started to look at Ethan inquisitively. 

If Ethan did not know anything, there was no way Ethan would have pointed him out. 
After all, he had been standing at the back, not attracting any attention. 

Chapter 2969 
It seemed like someone really was giving Ethan information about what happened in the 
inner city. They had even told Ethan What he looked like, which was how Ethan 
managed to point Jackie out in the crowd. 

Jackie took a deep breath as he frowned in exasperation. Trouble really did have a way 
of finding him wherever he went. He had thought that nothing troublesome would 
happen as long as he maintained a low enough profile. 

The sounds of mockery were constantly heard, and Hestia Continent’s alchemists were 
thoroughly embarrassed. All of them were incredibly angry as a few of them turned to 
glare at Jackie hatefully. 

It was like they were trying to tell Jackie that he was wrong with their eyes. 

When Jackie felt those gazes, he could not help but let out a laugh as he said, “What 
are you looking at me for? Am I the one mocking you? You don’t dare to face them, so 
you’re trying to face me instead?” 

Those people really were strange. It was clearly Ethan who ran over and started to 
mock them. It was clearly Ethan who had looked for trouble first. Yet, they knew that 
they could not beat Ethan, so they turned to look at Jackie. It was as if Jackie had been 
the one who did everything. 

Nash clenched his teeth and looked at Jackie hatefully, “I’ve never seen someone as 
shameless as you. Weren’t you the cause of this? If you didn’t insist on participating, 
would we have been insulted like this?!” 

Nash was furious, his chest rising up and down rapidly. He was practically about to 
erupt. He cast all his anger on Jackie, as if Jackie had been the reason for everyone. 

Jackie had insisted on participating even after they tried to stop him. So what if Jackie 
was here? 



There was no way Jackie could get any results. It was completely useless. 

They would just get humiliated even more. He was dragging down all the alchemists 
from Hestia Continent with him! 

Jackie raised an eyebrow, looking at Nash like he was looking at a stray dog by the 
streets. Ethan definitely knew something. He turned to look at Jackie curiously. There 
was not much mockery in his eyes, but instead curiosity. 

Ethan was curious as to where Jackie got the courage to say all of that. He laughed and 
said, “Brat, you can really talk. You seem to not be willing to submit to anyone. Do you 
think you’re the best in the world?” 

After saying that, Ethan could not help but to laugh. In his heart, he felt like Jackie’s 
actions were like those of a clown. He was merely trying to tease that clown. 

Jackie looked up and glanced at Ethan, “Are you trying to make sure everyone knows 
that you exist? You’re just like an ant, scurrying everywhere you can. It’s like you have 
to tell everyone that you’re amazing. If you really have the skills, you wouldn’t need to 
show off like this at all! You just look like a joke to me.” 

Those words immediately shocked everyone present, causing them to widen their eyes. 
They never expected that a sixth-grade alchemist from Hestia Continent would actually 
say something like that. He was practically cursing at Ethan, tossing Ethan’s dignity to 
the side. 

Jackie had completely stunned Ethan. 

Ethan’s lips twitched in anger, unable to even form any coherent thoughts. 

After Emilio heard that, he looked at Jackie in surprise. 

After that, he suddenly clapped in front of everyone, agreeing, “You really are quite 
brave. I have to say, your words are quite reasonable!” 

Chapter 2970 
As he said that, Jackie’s tone was incredibly calm. It was as if he was talking about 
something completely unimportant. Even though Ethan did not reveal everything, Jackie 
already managed to figure out the deeper meaning behind his words. 

Naturally, they were not allowed to fight at that moment. Furthermore, if the alchemists 
really started fighting, the results were not completely certain. 

So he wanted to say that, he might not be able to do anything to Jackie here, but he 
would not let Jackie off easily after Jackie returned to Hestia Continent. He would do 
everything he could to kill Jackie. 



After what happened in Hestia Continent thirty thousand years ago, Hestia Continent 
had been isolated from everything else. No one could go into other worlds through that 
barrier. If he wanted to kill Jackie, he would have to use Hestia Continent’ s warriors. 

That was where the problem came from. Ethan was an alchemist from White Marsh 
Continent. Normally, he should not have anything to do with Hestia Continent, so why 
would anyone be helping him? 

That involved a lot more things, but anyone with a brain could be able to understand 
many things from their conversation. 

Ethan froze, not expecting Jackie to grasp things so quickly. Jackie had actually figured 
things out before he could say anything. 

His lips stiffened as his eyes darted around. He suddenly regretted what he said. After 
all, some things should not have been revealed to the public. However, there was no 
way he could take back his words. Ethan did not try to explain anything, but the venom 
and hatred in his eyes deepened. He looked at Jackie as if Jackie was his mortal 
enemy. 

Jackie snorted, looking away and saying plainly, “There’s no reason to continue fighting 
like this. My skills, and whether I’ll drag Hestia Continent down will be seen when the 
results are out. Since I’m here taking part, I’m naturally confident enough to get a good 
placement.” 

Ethan’s eyes lit up when he heard that. He suddenly raised his voice as he said, “It 
looks like you really don’t know your place. Does a sixth-grade alchemist like you really 
think you‘ll amount to anything?!” 

Jackie’s words had given Ethan a chance to fight back He let out a cold smile as he 
continued, “There really are all sorts of people in the world. Do you think you can just 
brag however you want to? Look in a mirror before you speak. You’re a sixth-grade 
alchemist, do you really think you can get any good placements? You’re going to refine 
sixth-grade pills?” 

 


